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INTRALOT signs 10-year contract extension with the Idaho Lottery 
 

June 26, 2025 

INTRALOT S.A. is pleased to announce that its U.S. subsidiary, INTRALOT, Inc., and the Idaho Lottery 
have agreed to a 10-year contract extension, reaffirming an established partnership and based on 
INTRALOT’s commitment to deliver innovative, technology-based lottery equipment and services. 
The extension officially takes effect in September 2027 and will include the statewide roll-out of new 
industry-leading equipment to enhance player experiences, while increasing benefits – financially 
and in player satisfaction -for the State of Idaho and Gem State residents. 
 
Since 2007, INTRALOT’s partnership with the Idaho Lottery has provided the Gem State with secure 
and reliable gaming technology equipment and operational business solutions to meet Idaho’s 
marketplace. Under this extension, INTRALOT will deploy its state-of-the-art, cutting-edge gaming 
solution, LotosX OmniTM, at the heart of which lies LotosXTM, a best-in-class technology platform 
that ensures more efficient, reliable operations between the retailer and the Idaho Lottery, improved 
game development and game implementation, while maintaining Idaho’s renowned commitment 
for the highest level of security and public confidence.   
 
Additionally, the contract extension enables the Idaho Lottery to offer refined operational 
technologies at retail through the industry-leading award winning PhotonX terminal, the Dream 
Touch Flex vending terminal —an advanced self-service, player-activated machine that improves 
convenience and accessibility on both draw and instant games— and, CanvasX, INTRALOT’s latest 
content management system which unifies, elevates, and personalizes lottery content across all 
channels and user interfaces. The extension also includes comprehensive upgrades to all existing 
vending machines as well as enhanced security measures for ticket management. 

 
Andrew Arulanandam, Director of the Idaho Lottery stated: “The operational gaming system is the 
heart of any Lottery.  After thorough research, we found that INTRALOT has the best product. This 
extension allows us to improve our technology and provide quality services to our players while 
protecting the security and integrity of our games here in Idaho. This extension will provide increased 
dividends to public education and state building funds and it is in the best interest of Idaho’s citizenry 
and our state.” 
 
Richard Bateson, CEO of INTRALOT, Inc., stated: “We are honored to extend our partnership with 
the Idaho Lottery for another decade. This agreement underscores our shared commitment to 
innovation, security, and responsible gaming. With the introduction of LotosX OmniTM and Dream 
Touch Flex vending machines further improving player experience, we are confident that the Idaho 
Lottery will continue to grow and generate greater returns for Idaho’s schools and buildings.” 
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